
1:06 I would definitely say those are two 
things that for me – especially D&I – being a 
key part of that,

1:13 as well as something that they valued, 
that is actually seen in the interactions and 
engagements with other people,

1:19 that is something that, I would say, really 
makes Accenture stand out from

1:23 other companies and organizations out 
there that you may not necessarily get by just 
looking at the website.
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0:05 So, the way I say Accenture has fostered 
Diversity & Inclusion for me

0:09 is by just acknowledging all the identities 
that I carry. So, I am queer Latino individual, 

0:16 and being able to show up as my authentic 
self and haven’t been seen as something that is 
questionable,

0:22 or being treated differently, because of 
those identities. I can show up as my authentic 
self

0:28 and deliver the possible work that I can, 
my projects or my +1 involvements within the 
ERGs specifically,

0:34 and just be seen and acknowledged for 
those identities, I think it is one of the biggest 
ways Accenture has shown me their 
commitment to Diversity & Inclusion.

0:43 And that is not something that is said or 
that is written,

0:46 But it is really fostered and implemented, 
and shown through people’s actions and 
interactions with one another.

0:52 Accenture really does value its employees 
and there is a really strong culture about 
learning & development personally and 
professionally.

0:58 So, if this is something that you are 
seeking which was something that I was 
seeking. 

1:02 I was looking for a new position 
and stumbled across Accenture. 
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